
IN THE STATES OF THE ISLAND OF GUERNSEY 
ON THE 27th DAY OF NOVEMBER, 2019 

 
The States resolved as follows concerning Billet d’État No XXIII 

dated 8th November, 2019 
 
 

ELECTION OF A MEMBER OF THE 
ELIZABETH COLLEGE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

 
P.2019/115 

 
I: To elect Mrs Rosemary Anne Bowyer as a member of the Elizabeth College Board of 

Directors to replace Mrs Anne-Marie Collivert, whose term of office expired on the 5th 
January 2020, in accordance with Rule 16 of The Rules of Procedure of the States of 
Deliberation, as set out in Section 1 of The Rules of Procedure of the States of Deliberation 
and their Committees. 

 
 

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS LAID BEFORE THE STATES 
 
No. 98 of 2019 

THE FINANCIAL SERVICES OMBUDSMAN (CASE FEE AND LEVIES) (BAILIWICK OF GUERNSEY) 
AMENDMENT ORDER, 2019 

 
In pursuance of Section 27(3) of The Financial Services Ombudsman (Bailiwick of Guernsey) Law, 2014, 
as amended, “The Financial Services Ombudsman (Case Fee and Levies) Bailiwick of Guernsey) 
(Amendment) Order, 2019”, made by the Committee for Economic Development on 12th September, 
2019, was laid before the States.  

 
No. 99 of 2019 

THE WEIGHTS AND MEASURES (PRESCRIBED QUANTITIES) 
(EXEMPTIONS) REGULATIONS, 2019 

 

In pursuance of sections 20(1) and 61(1) of the Weights and Measures (Guernsey and Alderney) Law, 
1991, The Weights and Measures (Prescribed Quantities) (Exemptions) Regulations, 2019, made by the 
Committee for Home Affairs on 30th September 2019, were laid before the States. 

 
No. 100 of 2019 

THE WEIGHTS AND MEASURES (INTOXICATING LIQUOR) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2019 
 
In pursuance of sections 18(1) and (2) and 61(1) of the Weights and Measures (Guernsey and Alderney) 
Law, 1991, The Weights and Measures (Intoxicating Liquor) (Amendment) Regulations, 2019, made by 
the Committee for Home Affairs on 30th September 2019, were laid before the States. 

 
 



THE SOCIAL INSURANCE (RATES OF CONTRIBUTION AND BENEFITS, ETC.) ORDINANCE, 2019 
P.2019/108 

 
II.  To approve the draft Ordinance entitled "The Social Insurance (Rates of Contributions and   

Benefits, etc.) Ordinance, 2019", and to direct that the same shall have effect as an 
Ordinance of the States.  

 
 

THE HEALTH SERVICE (BENEFIT) (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2019 
P.2019/109 

 
III. To approve the draft Ordinance entitled "The Health Service (Benefit) (Amendment) 

Ordinance, 2019", and to direct that the same shall have effect as an Ordinance of the 
States.  

 
 

THE LONG-TERM CARE INSURANCE (GUERNSEY) (RATES) ORDINANCE, 2019 
P.2019/110 

 
IV. To approve the draft Ordinance entitled "The Health Service (Benefit) (Amendment) 

Ordinance, 2019", and to direct that the same shall have effect as an Ordinance of the 
States.  

 
 

THE SEVERE DISABILITY BENEFIT AND CARER'S ALLOWANCE ORDINANCE, 2019 
P.2019/111 

 
V.  To approve the draft Ordinance entitled "The Severe Disability Benefit and Carer's 

Allowance Ordinance, 2019", and to direct that the same shall have effect as an Ordinance 
of the States.  

 
 

THE INCOME SUPPORT (IMPLEMENTATION) (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2019 
P.2019/112 

 
VI. To approve the draft Ordinance entitled "The Income Support (Implementation) 

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2019", and to direct that the same shall have effect as an 
Ordinance of the States, subject to the following amendment - 

 
Immediately after section 1 add the following section – 

 
"1A. In paragraph 6 (rent) of the First Schedule to the Ordinance – 
 

(a) in subparagraph (1)(b), for "£75" substitute "£76.50", and 



(b) in subparagraph (2A)(a), for "£75" substitute "£76.50". 
 
 

THE FINANCIAL SERVICES OMBUDSMAN (BAILIWICK OF GUERNSEY) (AMENDMENT) (NO. 2) 
ORDINANCE, 2019 

P.2019/113 
 

VII. To approve the draft Ordinance entitled "The Financial Services Ombudsman (Bailiwick of 
Guernsey) (Amendment) (No. 2) Ordinance, 2019", and to direct that the same shall have 
effect as an Ordinance of the States.  

 
 

THE ELECTORAL ROLL ORDINANCE, 2019 
P.2019/114 

 
VIII. To approve the draft Ordinance entitled "The Electoral Roll Ordinance, 2019", and to direct 

that the same shall have effect as an Ordinance of the States.  
 

 
COMMITTEE FOR THE ENVIRONMENT & INFRASTRUCTURE  

 
ENVIRONMENTAL POLLUTION (GUERNSEY) LAW, 2004 

PART VII – AIR POLLUTION 
SUPPLEMENTARY POLICY LETTER 

P.2019/107 
 
IX.  After consideration of the Policy Letter entitled "Environmental Pollution (Guernsey) Law, 

2004, Part VII – Air Pollution – Supplementary Policy Letter”, dated 17th October 2019:-  
 
1. To prescribe the following as operations requiring a licence under Part III of the 

Environmental Pollution (Guernsey) Law, 2004 – 
 

a) the ‘Part B’ processes described in paragraphs 2.3 to 2.5 of that Policy Letter; and 
 

b) the 'Part A' processes described in paragraphs 2.8 to 2.10 of that Policy Letter. 
 

2. To approve the additional powers for the Director of Environmental Health and 
Pollution Regulation to make statutory instruments in relation to the technical matters 
set out in paragraph 2.13 of that Policy Letter. 

 
3. To approve the draft Ordinances entitled –  

 



a) “The Environmental Pollution (Guernsey) Law, 2004 (Commencement) Ordinance, 
2019”, as set out in Appendix 1; 
 

b) "The Environmental Pollution (Air Pollution) Ordinance, 2019", as set out in Appendix 
2; and 
 

c) "The Environmental Pollution (Enforcement and Appeals) Ordinance, 2019", as set 
out in Appendix 3, 

 
and to direct that each of the same shall have effect as an Ordinance of the States. 
 
 

C. FOSTER 
 

HER MAJESTY’S DEPUTY GREFFIER 


