
 

STATES OF DELIBERATION 

 

27
th

 November, 2013 

 

Billet d'État No. XXII 

Article 9 

 

AMENDMENT 

 

Policy Council 

Disability and Inclusion Strategy 
 

 

Proposed by:   Deputy E G Bebb 

Seconded by:   Deputy S A James 

 

To insert at the end of the words in Proposition 10 “and report back to the States of 

Deliberation on this matter by no later than the end of 2016”. 

 

 



 

STATES OF DELIBERATION 

 

27
th

 November, 2013 

 

Billet d'État No. XXII 

Article 9 

 

AMENDMENT 

 

Policy Council – Disability and Inclusion Strategy 

 

 

Proposed by:   Deputy E G Bebb 

Seconded by:  Deputy K A Stewart 

 

In Proposition 5 –  

(i) delete “£170,000” and substitute “£250,000” and  

(ii) in article a. delete “£70.000” and substitute “£150.000”. 

 

 

Explanatory note  

 

For the avoidance of any doubt, there is no change in the source of funding for this increase 

and it is not anticipated this amendment would have any effect on the States Fiscal and 

Economic Policy Plan 

 

 

 

 



STATES OF DELIBERATION 
  

27th November, 2013 
 

Billet d'État No. XXII of 2013 
Article 9 

 
AMENDMENT 

 
 
 
Proposed by:  Deputy P R Le Pelley 
Seconded by:  Deputy M J Fallaize 
 

Policy Council –  
Disability and Inclusion Strategy 

 
 
In Proposition 12, to delete “December 2016” and substitute therefor “September 2015”. 
 



 

STATES OF DELIBERATION 

 

27th November 2013 

 

Billet d'État No. XXII 

Article 9 

 

AMENDMENT 

 

Policy Council 

Disability and Inclusion Strategy  

 

 

 

Proposed by:   Deputy A M Wilkie 

Seconded by: Deputy C Green  

 

To replace Proposition 7 as follows:  

 

7.  To agree the funding of the Disability and Equality Officer post at a level 

commensurate with the responsibilities of that position. 

 

 

Explanatory Note 

 

This amendment ensures that it is clear that Policy Council has the flexibility to recruit to the 

requirements of the role at an appropriate level. 

 

 


